

**BID RESULT FORM  
CITY OF DANBURY**

**Bid #01-18-19-03 "Paving in Place and Related Services"**

**Bid Date: Thursday, February 28, 2019**

**10:00 A.M.**

*10/28*

Bidder→	The Grasso Companies	Asphalt Repair Solutions	Waters Paving	Tilcon Connecticut
<b>Section A. – Paving in Place Machine Laid</b>				
Class 1	\$92.13	\$89.97	\$85.60	\$97.00
Class 2	\$97.60	\$96.77	\$92.10	\$103.00
Class 12	\$125.00	\$145.58	\$115.00	\$125.00
Super Pave HMA SO.375"	\$93.15	\$97.79	\$92.18	\$101.00
Super Pave HMA SO. 5"	\$99.60	\$92.28	\$87.22	\$96.00
Machine Laid Curbing				
4"	\$4.75	\$4.80	\$4.05	\$4.00
6"	\$5.75	\$5.90	\$4.40	\$5.00
Pressurized Applied Tack	\$7.00	\$6.09	\$6.60	\$7.00
<b>Section B.-"Shimming"-Machine Laid</b>				
Super Pave HMA SO.375"	\$110.00	\$103.55	\$98.80	\$111.00
Super Pave HMA SO. 5"	\$105.00	\$104.00	\$97.80	\$106.00
Class 2	\$108.00	\$102.58	\$97.85	\$110.00
126.00Class 12	\$115.00	\$145.58	\$115.00	\$126.00
Pressurized Applied Tack Coat	\$7.00	\$6.09	\$6.60	\$7.00
<b>Section C – Handwork Outside Machine Laid Areas</b>				
Super Pave HMA SO.375"	\$175.00	\$228.66	\$195.00	\$214.00
Super Pave HMA SO. 5"	\$175.00	\$223.15	\$194.00	\$210.00
Class 1	\$175.00	\$220.84	\$194.00	\$208.00
Class 2	\$175.00	\$227.65	\$198.00	\$213.50
Class 12	\$200.00	\$242.34	\$220.00	\$225.00
<b>Section D – Trim Milling Roadways</b>				
Trim Mill Machine w/Operator	\$300.00	\$278.00	N/A	\$265.00
Manufacturer/Model/Mill Width	Wirtgen W500+W50	Wirtgen W500 18"	N/A	Wirtgen W50 Cold planner/20in 500 mm Drum
Mobilization Cost (drop off & pick up)	\$700.00	\$	N/A	\$975.00

**BID RESULT FORM  
CITY OF DANBURY**

Bid #01-18-19-03 "Paving in Place and Related Services"

Bid Date: Thursday, February 28, 2019

10:00 A.M.

Bidder→	The Grasso Companies	Asphalt Repair Solutions	Waters Paving	Tilcon Connecticut
<b>Section E - Milling Roadways</b>				
<b>Milling Asphalt Roadways - All Inclusive</b>				
Area Size 0 to 1000 0" to 5"	\$17.00	\$16.73	NO BID	\$13.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 0" to 5"	\$4.90	\$4.48	NO BID	\$3.75
Area Size 5001 to + 0" to 5"	\$2.18	\$2.67	NO BID	\$3.00
Area Size 0 to 1000 5" to 10"	\$19.00	\$14.75	NO BID	\$16.50
Area Size 1001 to 5000 5" to 10"	\$9.25	\$10.28	NO BID	\$5.50
Area Size 5001 to + 5" to 10"	\$5.00	\$4.90	NO BID	\$4.50
<b>Alternate Bid - Milling Asphalt Roadways All Inclusive (nights/weekends/holidays)</b>				
Area Size 0 to 1000 0" to 5"	\$17.00	\$12.94	NO BID	\$14.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 0" to 5"	\$6.00	\$4.77	NO BID	\$4.00
Area Size 5001 to + 0" to 5"	\$2.60	\$2.94	NO BID	\$3.50
Area Size 0 to 1000 5" to 10"	\$19.00	\$19.78	NO BID	\$18.50
Area Size 1001 to 5000 5" to 10"	\$11.00	\$6.47	NO BID	\$6.00
Area Size 5001 to + 5" to 10"	\$6.20	\$5.20	NO BID	\$5.00
<b>Section F - Milling Parking Lots Milling Asphalt Parking Lots - All Inclusive</b>				
Area Size 0 to 1000 0" to 5"	\$17.00	\$15.57	NO BID	\$15.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 0" to 5"	\$6.00	\$4.77	NO BID	\$4.00
Area Size 5001 to + 0" to 5"	\$3.00	\$3.25	NO BID	\$3.50
Area Size 0 to 1000 5" to 10"	\$19.00	\$17.78	NO BID	\$16.50
Area Size 1001 to 5000 5" to 10"	\$11.00	\$6.80	NO BID	\$5.50
Area Size 5001 to + 5" to 10"	\$6.75	\$5.77	NO BID	\$5.00

2 of 8

3 of 8

BID RESULT FORM  
CITY OF DANBURY

Bid #01-18-19-03 "Paving in Place and Related Services"

Bid Date: Thursday, February 28, 2019

10:00 A.M.

Bidder→	The Grasso Companies	Asphalt Repair Solutions	Waters Paving	Tilcon Connecticut
Alternate Bid- Milling Asphalt Parking Lots All Inclusive (nights/weekend/holidays)				
Area Size 0 to 1000 0" to 5"	\$17.00	\$13.71	NO BID	\$16.50
Area Size 1001 to 5000 0" to 5"	\$6.00	\$5.01	NO BID	\$5.00
Area Size 5001 to + 0" to 5"	\$3.00	\$3.99	NO BID	\$4.00
Area Size 0 to 1000 5" to 10"	\$19.00	\$21.75	NO BID	\$19.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 5" to 10"	\$11.00	\$6.80	NO BID	\$6.00
Area Size 5001 to + 5" to 10"	\$6.75	\$6.09	NO BID	\$5.50
Section G – Pavement Reclamation of Roadways				
Reclaiming, Grading & Compaction of Asphalt Roadways All Inclusive				
Area Size 0 to 1000	\$8.25	\$9.20	NO BID	\$12.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000	\$6.25	\$6.81	NO BID	\$5.75
Area Size 5001 to +	\$4.25	\$4.50	NO BID	\$5.00
Liquid Calcium Application/ Gallon	\$10.00	\$1.95	NO BID	\$2.25
Liquid Calcium Application/ Rate Sq. Yd.	111	1	NO BID	20
Alternate Bid- Reclaiming, Grading & Compaction of Asphalt Roadways All Inclusive (nights/weekends/holidays)				
Area Size 0 to 1000	\$8.75	\$9.65	NO BID	\$12.50
Area Size 1001 to 5000	\$6.75	\$7.16	NO BID	\$6.50
Area Size 5001 to +	\$4.75	\$5.15	NO BID	\$5.50

**BID RESULT FORM  
CITY OF DANBURY**

Bid #01-18-19-03 "Paving in Place and Related Services"

Bid Date: Thursday, February 28, 2019

10:00 A.M.

4 of 8

Bidder→	The Grasso Companies	Asphalt Repair Solutions	Waters Paving	Ticon Connecticut
<b>Section H – Pavement Reclamation of Parking Lots</b>				
<b>Reclaiming, Grading &amp; Compaction of Asphalt Parking Lots All Inclusive</b>				
Area Size 0 to 1000	\$8.35	\$9.00	NO BID	\$12.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000	\$6.35	\$6.90	NO BID	\$5.75
Area Size 5001 to +	\$4.35	\$4.75	NO BID	\$5.00
Liquid Calcium Application/ Gallon	\$10.00	\$1.95	NO BID	\$2.25
Liquid Calcium Application/ Rate Sq. Yd.	111	1	NO BID	20
<b>Alternate Bid - Reclaiming, Grading &amp; Compaction of Asphalt Parking Lots All Inclusive (nights/weekends/Holidays)</b>				
Area Size 0 to 1000	\$8.75	\$11.00	NO BID	\$13.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000	\$6.75	\$8.00	NO BID	\$7.00
Area Size 5001 to +	\$4.75	\$5.50	NO BID	\$6.50
<b>Section I – Traffic Control</b>				
<b>Description/Rates</b>				
Danbury Police Officer - \$76.90 per hour/ per officer	Danbury Police Officer - \$76.90 per hour/ per officer	Danbury Police Officer - \$76.90 per hour/ per officer	Danbury Police Officer - \$76.90 per hour/ per officer	Danbury Police Officer - \$76.90 per hour/ per officer
Danbury Police Officer/Holiday - \$102.05 per hour/per officer	Danbury Police Officer/Holiday - \$102.05 per hour/per officer	Danbury Police Officer/Holiday - \$102.05 per hour/per officer	Danbury Police Officer/Holiday - \$102.05 per hour/per officer	Danbury Police Officer/Holiday - \$102.05 per hour/per officer
Danbury Police Cruiser - \$176.00 per day (8 hours) per vehicle	Danbury Police Cruiser - \$176.00 per day (8 hours) per vehicle	Danbury Police Cruiser - \$176.00 per day (8 hours) per vehicle	Danbury Police Cruiser - \$176.00 per day (8 hours) per vehicle	Danbury Police Cruiser - \$176.00 per day (8 hours) per vehicle
Certified Flagger - \$55.00 per hour/per flagger	Certified Flagger - \$55.00 per hour/per flagger	Certified Flagger - \$55.00 per hour/per flagger	Certified Flagger - \$55.00 per hour/per flagger	Certified Flagger - \$55.00 per hour/per flagger

**BID RESULT FORM  
CITY OF DANBURY**

Bid #01-18-19-03 "Paving in Place and Related Services"

Bid Date: Thursday, February 28, 2019

10:00 A.M.

*5 of 8*

Bidder →	Garity Asphalt Reclaiming, Inc.	Rafferty Fine Grading, Inc.	Alcaide, Inc. /dba- A&J Construction
<b>Section A. – Paving in Place Machine Laid</b>			
Class 1	NO BID	NO BID	\$84.45
Class 2	NO BID	NO BID	\$90.95
Class 12	NO BID	NO BID	\$125.00
Super Pave HMA SO.375"	NO BID	NO BID	\$91.95
Super Pave HMA SO. 5"	NO BID	NO BID	\$86.65
Machine Laid Curbing			
4"	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.95
6"	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.95
Pressurized Applied Tack	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.95
<b>Section B. – "Shimming" – Machine Laid</b>			
Super Pave HMA SO.375"	NO BID	NO BID	\$98.50
Super Pave HMA SO. 5"	NO BID	NO BID	\$98.50
Class 2	NO BID	NO BID	\$105.0
Class 12	NO BID	NO BID	\$125.00
Pressurized Applied Tack Coat	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.95
<b>Section C – Handwork Outside Machine Laid Areas</b>			
Super Pave HMA SO.375"	NO BID	NO BID	\$187.50
Super Pave HMA SO. 5"	NO BID	NO BID	\$187.50
Class 1	NO BID	NO BID	\$187.50
Class 2	NO BID	NO BID	\$187.50
Class 12	NO BID	NO BID	\$200.00
<b>Section D – Trim Milling Roadways</b>			
Trim Mill Machine w/Operator	\$310.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
Manufacturer/Model/Mill Width	Wirtgen 50 20"	Wirtgen W60Ri 30"	Wirtgen W50DC
Mobilization Cost (drop off & pick up)	\$450.00	\$2,000.00	\$750.00

6 of 8

**BID RESULT FORM  
CITY OF DANBURY**

Bid #01-18-19-03 "Paving in Place and Related Services"

Bid Date: Thursday, February 28, 2019

10:00 A.M.

Bidder→	Garry Asphalt Reclaiming, Inc.	Rafferty Fine Grading, Inc.	Alcaide, Inc. /dba- A&J Construction
<b>Section E - Milling Roadways</b>			
<b>Milling Asphalt Roadways - All Inclusive</b>			
Area Size 0 to 1000 0" to 5"	\$13.75	\$20.00	\$16.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 0" to 5"	\$4.50	\$12.00	\$5.00
Area Size 5001 to + 0" to 5"	\$2.80	\$3.00	\$2.75
Area Size 0 to 1000 5" to 10"	\$16.00	NO BID	\$20.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 5" to 10"	\$9.00	NO BID	\$9.00
Area Size 5001 to + 5" to 10"	\$6.00	NO BID	\$6.00
<b>Alternate Bid - Milling Asphalt Roadways</b>			
<b>All Inclusive (nights/weekends/holidays)</b>			
Area Size 0 to 1000 0" to 5"	\$15.00	\$25.00	\$20.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 0" to 5"	\$4.85	\$15.00	\$5.00
Area Size 5001 to + 0" to 5"	\$3.05	\$4.00	\$3.00
Area Size 0 to 1000 5" to 10"	\$19.00	NO BID	\$25.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 5" to 10"	\$9.50	NO BID	\$10.00
Area Size 5001 to + 5" to 10"	\$6.50	NO BID	\$6.00
<b>Section F - Milling Parking Lots</b>			
<b>Milling Asphalt Parking Lots - All Inclusive</b>			
Area Size 0 to 1000 0" to 5"	\$13.50	\$20.00	\$17.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 0" to 5"	\$4.75	\$12.00	\$6.00
Area Size 5001 to + 0" to 5"	\$3.25	\$3.00	\$3.50
Area Size 0 to 1000 5" to 10"	\$16.00	NO BID	\$21.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 5" to 10"	\$10.00	NO BID	\$10.00
Area Size 5001 to + 5" to 10"	\$6.00	NO BID	\$6.75

**BID RESULT FORM**  
**CITY OF DANBURY**

Bid #01-18-19-03 "Paving in Place and Related Services"

Bid Date: Thursday, February 28, 2019

10:00 A.M.

Bidder ->	Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming, Inc.	Rafferty Fine Grading, Inc.	Alcaide, Inc. /dba- A&J Construction
<b>Alternate Bid- Milling Asphalt Parking Lots All Inclusive (nights/weekend/holidays)</b>			
Area Size 0 to 1000 0" to 5"	\$15.00	\$25.00	\$21.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 0" to 5"	\$5.25	\$15.00	\$6.00
Area Size 5001 to + 0" to 5"	\$3.75	\$4.00	\$3.75
Area Size 0 to 1000 5" to 10"	\$17.00	NO BID	\$26.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000 5" to 10"	\$11.00	NO BID	\$11.00
Area Size 5001 to + 5" to 10"	\$6.75	NO BID	\$6.75
<b>Section G - Pavement Reclamation of Roadways</b>			
<b>Reclaiming, Grading &amp; Compaction of Asphalt Roadways All Inclusive</b>			
Area Size 0 to 1000	\$6.00	\$20.00	\$10.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000	\$3.50	\$12.00	\$6.75
Area Size 5001 to +	\$2.35	\$3.00	\$4.50
Liquid Calcium Application/ Gallon	\$1.40	\$1.75	\$1.50
Liquid Calcium Application/ Rate Sq. Yd.	1	1	As Directed
<b>Alternate Bid- Reclaiming, Grading &amp; Compaction of Asphalt Roadways All Inclusive (nights/weekends/holidays)</b>			
Area Size 0 to 1000	\$8.00	\$25.00	\$15.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000	\$7.00	\$15.00	\$7.50
Area Size 5001 to +	\$4.50	\$4.00	\$5.00

7 of 8

**BID RESULT FORM  
CITY OF DANBURY**

Bid #01-18-19-03 "Paving in Place and Related Services"

Bid Date: Thursday, February 28, 2019

10:00 A.M.

Bidder →	Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming, Inc.	Rafferty Fire Grading, Inc.	Alcaide, Inc./dba-A&J Construction
<b>Section H – Pavement Reclamation of Parking Lots</b>			
<b>Reclaiming, Grading &amp; Compaction of Asphalt Parking Lots All Inclusive</b>			
Area Size 0 to 1000	\$8.50	\$20.00	\$11.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000	\$6.50	\$12.00	\$7.25
Area Size 5001 to +	\$4.00	\$3.00	\$5.00
Liquid Calcium Application/ Gallon	\$1.40	\$1.75	\$1.50
Liquid Calcium Application/ Rate Sq. Yd.	1	1	As Directed
<b>Alternate Bid - Reclaiming, Grading &amp; Compaction of Asphalt Parking Lots All Inclusive (nights/weekends/Holidays)</b>			
Area Size 0 to 1000	\$9.50	\$25.00	\$16.00
Area Size 1001 to 5000	\$7.50	\$15.00	\$8.00
Area Size 5001 to +	\$4.50	\$4.00	\$5.50
<b>Section I – Traffic Control</b>			
<b>Description/Rates</b>			
Danbury Police Officer - \$76.90 per hour/ per officer	Danbury Police Officer - \$76.90 per hour/ per officer	Danbury Police Officer - \$76.90 per hour/ per officer	Danbury Police Officer - \$76.90 per hour/ per officer
Danbury Police Officer/Holiday - \$102.05 per hour/per officer	Danbury Police Officer/Holiday - \$102.05 per hour/per officer	Danbury Police Officer/Holiday - \$102.05 per hour/per officer	Danbury Police Officer/Holiday - \$102.05 per hour/per officer
Danbury Police Cruiser - \$176.00 per day (8 hours) per vehicle	Danbury Police Cruiser - \$176.00 per day (8 hours) per vehicle	Danbury Police Cruiser-\$176.00 per day (8 hours) per vehicle	Danbury Police Cruiser - \$176.00 per day (8 hours) per vehicle
Certified Flagger - \$55.00 per hour/per flagger	Certified Flagger - \$55.00 per hour/per flagger	Certified Flagger - \$55.00 per hour/per flagger	Certified Flagger - \$55.00 per hour/per flagger

Attending: B.Schlemmer, J. Thompson

Comments: Awards Committee

If low bid is not bid of award, please specify reasons why it is not acceptable.

**AWARDED TO:**

Awards Committee Initial:  
Finance Director  
Corporation Counsel  
Department Head

Tax Office \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_

Purchasing Agent \_\_\_\_\_ DATE \_\_\_\_\_

*S of 18*