

BID RESULT FORM

City of Danbury

Bid #03-18-19-04 "Chemicals – Water Department"

Bid Date: Thursday, April 25, 2019

10:00 A.M.

PAGE 1 OF 2

Bidder	Item 1. Sulfate of Alumina Unit Price	Item 2. Hydrofluosilicic Acid Unit Price	Item 3. Copper Sulfate Unit Price	Item 4. Sodium Hydroxide Unit Price	Item 5. Sodium Hypochlorite Unit Price	Item 6. Orthophosphoric Acid Unit Price	Item 7. Potassium Permanganate Unit Price	LUMP SUM TOTAL
CHEMTRADE	* \$0.0967	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$212,740.00
HARCROS CHEMICALS INC.	NO BID	NO BID	\$72.4900	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.6100	\$85,370.00
SLACK CHEMICAL CO. INC	NO BID	\$0.339	NO BID	\$0.1399	\$0.094	NO BID	NO BID	\$217,361.00
CARUS CORP.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.33	NO BID	\$23,100.00
BORDEN & REMINGTON CORP.	NO BID	\$1.1995	NO BID	\$1.143	\$1.1055	NO BID	\$2.0766	\$200,304.80
GEORGE S. COYNE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.218	\$2.1789	\$46,957.20
FAESY & BESTHOFF	NO BID	NO BID	\$68.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$68,500.00
HOLLAND CO.	\$0.106	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$233,200.00
SHANNON CHEMICAL CORP.	NO BID	\$0.337	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.372	\$1.72	\$80,240.00
MARUBENI SPECIALTY CHEMICALS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	1.521	\$12,168.00
JCI JONES CHEMICALS INC.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.0798	\$0.081	NO BID	NO BID	\$115,572.00
KUEHNE CO.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.1375	\$0.135	NO BID	NO BID	\$196,625.00
UNIVAR USA INC.	NO BID	\$0.20	NO BID	0.0905	NO BID	NO BID	1.83	\$119,185.00
MONSON COMPANIES, LLC	NO BID	\$0.2145 / \$0.2935	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$60,960.00
NEW HAVEN CHLOR-ALKALI LLC	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.0977	\$0.0979	NO BID	NO BID	\$140,798.00
SURPASS CHEMICAL CO. INC.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.108	\$1.109	NO BID	\$1.594	\$168,822.00
CHEMRITE, INC.	NO BID	NO BID	\$88.48	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	1.76	\$102,560.00
AMERICAN INTERNATIONAL CHEMICAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	1.85	\$14,800.00

Bid Date: Thursday, April 25, 2019

Bidder	Item 1. Sulfate of Alumina Unit Price	Item 2. Hydrofluosilicic Acid Unit Price	Item 3. Copper Sulfate Unit Price	Item 4. Sodium Hydroxide Unit Price	Item 5. Sodium Hypochlorite Unit Price	Item 6. Orthophosphoric Acid Unit Price	Item 7. Potassium Permanganate Unit Price	LUMP SUM TOTAL
GEO SPECIALTY CHEMICALS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
KEMIRA WATER SOLUTIONS INC.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Attending: C. Volpe, Brenda Schlemmer

Awards Committee Initials:

Finance Director

Corporation Counsel

Department Head

Comments: Awards Committee

If low bid is not bid of award, please specify reasons why it is not acceptable.

AWARDED TO: _____

Tax Office _____

DATE

Purchasing Agent _____

DATE